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America, we have a problem! On the 25th of May, NPR reported that 145 days (21 
weeks) into 2022, the United States had suffered through 213 mass shootings. 
This rate averages slightly more than 10 mass shootings per week. Assault 
weapons, more often AR15s and various types of AKs, have been the weapons of 
choice; used in the seven deadliest mass shootings in the last decade[1].  
 

On May 14, 2022, ten people were killed and three injured at a grocery store in 
Buffalo, New York. Ten days later, in Uvalde, Texas, 19 children and two adults 
were killed with a military assault weapon. America suffered a similar massacre a 
decade earlier at Sandy Hook Elementary School in Newtown, Connecticut, the 
deadliest school shooting in America’s history.  
 

Clearly, America has a problem! When public spaces, once perceived to be safe, 
such as movie theaters, churches, synagogues, outdoor festivals, grocery stores 
and elementary schools, have become the crime scenes of America’s deadliest 
mass shootings. What is America’s problem? Is it the constitutional interpretation 
of the Second Amendment and the citizen’s legal right to bear arms? Or is the 
problem with state legislatures who institute more permissive gun laws by 
requiring fewer and less stringent background checks?  
 

Hubert Humphrey, former Vice President of the United States once affirmed, 
“(T)he moral test of government is how that government treats those who are in 



the dawn of life, the children; those who are in the twilight of life, the elderly; 
those who are in the shadows of life; the sick, the needy and the handicapped[2].” 
Capitalism is devouring democracy and is central to the devolution of morality in 
America. I am not suggesting that we abandon capitalism. However, I am 
suggesting it is the cupidity of many capitalists that has transformed our children 
into commodities. The central debate is not the viability of the Second 
Amendment applied in a 21st century American society but the lives of our 
children and our citizenry.  
 

The problem is how we as Americans value human life. What is the economic 
value of a child? This is an unthinkable and a repulsive question to entertain. Yet, 
many elected officials, individuals who were chosen to govern, protect, and serve, 
apply a custom of capitalism; laissez-faire economics where private wealthy 
owners and the laws of supply and demand determine policy and price. The 
exchange is human life, children and seniors, our most vulnerable citizens, for 
political and economic profit.  
 

The essence of my argument is found in the Preamble of the Declaration of 
Independence: We hold these truths to be self-evident, that all men are created 
equal, that they are endowed by their Creator with certain unalienable Rights, that 
among these are Life, Liberty and the pursuit of Happiness. – That to secure these 
rights, Governments are instituted among Men, deriving their just powers from 
the consent of the governed. – That whenever any Form of Government becomes 
destructive of these ends, it is the Right of the People to alter or to abolish it, and 
to institute new Government, laying its foundation on such principles and 
organizing its powers in such form, as to them shall seem most likely to effect 
their Safety and Happiness[3]. 
 

Currently, there are two bills, H.R. 8, the Bipartisan Background Checks Act of 
2021 and H.R. 1446, the Enhanced Background Checks of 2021, proposed to 
increase gun control through expanded background checks that have been passed 
in the House, but have not received Senate approval. This refusal by the Senate 
goes against the grain of most Americans (approximately 90 percent) who, 
regardless of political affiliation, support stricter background checks. This 
demonstration of deliberate indifference is disturbing. More disturbing is a recent 
analysis by the Washington Post that reported the median age for school shooters 
is 16 years. Military assault weapons, designed to kill quickly and efficiently, are 
used more often by adolescents. The meaning of AR15 is a .223 caliber gas-
operated semiautomatic rifle that is essentially a civilian version of the military’s 
M16.   
 

The greater existential debate is the decay in democracy, the right for all 
Americans to pursue life, liberty, and happiness. For most survivors of mass 
shootings their daily pursuits are found in recurrent struggles to find meaning 
and understanding regarding the actions of demented individuals, armed with 



military assault weapons, who have forever changed their lives. Given the carnage 
our country has repeatedly witnessed there is no morally justifiable reasons for 
civilians to have military assault weapons. This statement has been the articulated 
sentiment of family members who have lost someone in a mass shooting. 
 

If our government is ineffective or caustic in the defense of its citizenry, people 
have a moral obligation to elect new government officials who are committed to 
defending the right of every person to life, liberty, security, and safety. The lives of 
our children, their education, and the limitless possibilities contained in their 
futures cannot not be left in the callous hands of people interested only in profits, 
political posture, or to those who just don’t give a damn! Our children are not 
politically expedient experiments, with raw data extrapolated and reported in 
aggregation so as not be identified. These are our children, some of whom were 
identified by smiles, honor cards, or their parents DNA samples. The message is 
clear: Elect those individuals who view the protection our children over party 
politics.  
 

The victims of Sandy Hook, Charleston, Pittsburgh, El Paso, Buffalo, and now 
Uvalde will have died in vain; their sacrifices empty if another decade ends 
without substantive changes in gun laws. The continued political debate over 
Second Amendment rights, guided by self-interest, and the position of 50 
obdurate American Senators driven by avarice will foster more deaths. We can be 
sure that if nothing changes nothing will change … and the well-intentioned 
gestures; our thoughts and prayers are with you, the moments of silence, flags 
drawn at half-mast, and offering our heartfelt condolences again and again, will 
become empty, meaningless tributes. In many respects, they already have. 
 

The definition of insanity, commonly used in recovery communities (AA and NA) 
is doing the same thing over and over again and expecting different results. We 
don't know when or where, but tragically and most assuredly, most Americans 
know there will be another mass shooting, and another, and another, and another, 
and another, and another, and another, and another, and another, and another 
(10 per week) if our federal and state governments do not protect the most 
vulnerable and most precious element of our republic, our children.  
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